




1 Nevertheless, there will be 
no more gloom for those 

who were in distress…



2 The people walking in 
darkness have seen a 

great light;



on those living in the land 
of deep darkness a light 

has dawned…



6 For to us a child is born, 
to us a son is given, and 

the government will be on 
his shoulders.



And he will be called 
Wonderful Counselor, 

Mighty God, Everlasting 
Father, .



7 Of the greatness of his 
government and 

there will be no end.



22 All this took place to 
fulfill what the Lord had 

said through the prophet:
Matt 1:22-23



23 “The virgin will conceive 
and give birth to a son, 

and they will call him 
Immanuel” (which means 

“God with us”).





Do not be anxious about 
anything, but in every 

situation, by prayer and 
petition, with thanksgiving, 

present your requests to 
God. 

Phil 4:6 NIV



For he himself is our 
, who has made the 

two groups one and has 
destroyed the barrier, the 
dividing wall of hostility.

Eph 2:14













No Jesus. No .



But you, O Bethlehem of 
Ephrathah, who are one of 

the little clans of Judah,



from you shall come forth 
for me one who is to rule in 
Israel, whose origin is from 

of old, from ancient days.



Therefore he shall give 
them up until the time 

when she who is in labor 
has brought forth;



then the rest of his kindred 
shall return to the people 

of Israel.



And he shall stand and 
feed his flock in the 

strength of the LORD, in 
the majesty of the name of 

the LORD his God.



And they shall live secure, 
for now he shall be great to 

the ends of the earth; and 
he shall be the one of 

. 
Micah 5:2-5 NRSV



No Jesus. No .



Know Jesus. Know .





And the of God, 
which transcends all 

understanding, will guard 
your hearts and your 

minds in Christ Jesus. 
Phil 4:7 NIV









No Jesus. No .

Know Jesus. Know .




